
 
 

 
 

CODE OF ETHICS AND BUSINESS CONDUCT 
 
 
1. INTRODUCTION 
 
This Code constitutes a set of postulates and guidelines to which all employees of the 
company Scott Bader d.o.o. adhere and to which they aspire, and of provisions on 
responsibility for their implementation. The term ‘employee’ encompasses all persons 
employed by the company full-time, part-time or under contract. 
 
 
2. POSTULATES AND GUIDELINES 
 
The employees of Scott Bader hereby assent and warrant that the right to work is a 
fundamental human right and that it serves general progress only if it is based on 
morality, law and freedom of thought. This right is exercised by means of joint and 
individual activity, although accountability is always individual. Activities must be 
based on respect for others and mutual esteem. Management is the highest form of 
this activity, and its success is not possible without unity and firm personal integrity. 
 
Pursuant to these postulates, all employees of Scott Bader knowingly and consistently 
accept the following guidelines: 
 
1)  Adherence to all company by-laws and laws and legal regulations. 
 
2)  Maintenance of the highest standards of ethics and morality regardless of 
pressure exerted by individuals or groups inside or outside of the company. Each 
employee is entitled and duty-bound to refuse to comply with orders which include the 
violation of this Code with no legal nor moral consequences whatsoever for such 
refusal. 
 
3)  Adherence to technological and labour discipline and conscientious execution of 
all contracts and agreements. In this regard, verbal orders, agreements and pledges 
have the same ethical force as their written counterparts. 
 
4)  A continuous aspiration to a high level of individual achievement and 
professional, intellectual and mental betterment, and selfless assistance to others for 
this purpose. 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
5)  Orientation of one’s activity toward the preservation and enhancement of the 
company’s intellectual and physical assets, and its reputation and status in society, 
with particular emphasis on protection of all employees during work processes and 
protection of the environment as a whole. Within the framework of this guideline, all of 
the innovations and technical and operational improvements accomplished by an 
employee during the regular performance of his/her duties shall be deemed the 
intellectual property of the company. 
 
6)  Readiness to cooperate and unselfish sharing of one’s knowledge with all 
employees of Scott Bader, and with its business partners, unless such knowledge 
constitutes one of the company’s trade secrets. 
 
 
3. RESPONSIBILITY 
 
The management, managers and all employees shall be obliged to adhere to this Code 
and foster the conditions whereunder each employee is able to adhere to its 
standards. 
 
Any violation of this Code represents unprofessional conduct, especially where it 
involves endangering the well-being of the Company and its employees, endangering 
its natural environment, proven malice, a serious lack of expertise, ill judgement, 
distorting facts, forgery, bribery, revealing business secrets, and the abuse of assigned 
authorizations with the intent of making an employee violate the Code or for personal 
gain. Any such violation of the Code is considered a serious breach of job 
responsibility and may result in a withdrawal of previously assigned authorizations or 
one's position in the organization, suspension, while, in more serious cases, may 
provide a basis for termination of employment.  
 
Any violation of this Code which at the same time represents a violation of legal 
regulations shall result in legal action being taken as well as sanctions stipulated by 
law.  
 
Repetitious violation of the Code shall be sanctioned as an extremely dishonourable 
act.  
 
The provisions of this Code shall be interpreted and implemented by the Board of 
Scott Bader d.o.o., with participation of the representative(s) of the employees' trade 
union and the Commonwealth.  
 
 


